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INTRODUCTION
Well, well, well, here we are now. You were stubborn, you didn’t listen, and we now have no
choice but to pay the price. I am writing this from the future, and the world is now a different
place. Then you saw birds chirping gleefully, now we have to endure the ear-splitting cries of
those same birds. The skies once filled with sublime shades of blue are now infested with
industrial shades of grey and black. You had the chance to change the course of history, giving
your waste a second chance, instead of them ruling the world. Do the right thing, don’t let your
subconscious mind, corrupted with dormance and greed take over.
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HOW DO YOU RECYCLE?
You may be wondering “How do I recycle?” Well, It is not that hard. All you have to do is ensure
that your bins (General waste bin, Recycling waste bin and Food waste bin) are used as
recommended, but there is more to that than just bins. Here are the best tips for recycling in
town. Try to create craft out of waste. It not only helps the environment, but also creates cute
decor for your house. Try not to use more than you actually need. Even though it seems silly, it
works. Don’t use single use plastic, or any single use material for that matter. And finally, Don’t
put things in the wrong bin, like come on, it ruins everyone else’s work. And remember,
Recycling should be omnipresent.

DIFFERENCE BETWEEN A RECYCLING AND
NON-RECYCLING EARTH
You still may be wondering, “What is the reason for me to recycle?” Recycling is essential,
because of the fact that a recycling and non-recycling Earth are hardly similar, just ask 78% of
sea animals and 62% of land animals about their past here in 2050. Recycling can do wonders to
any industry in existence. This may seem exaggerated, but it is true. We know the obvious,
conserving natural resources, reducing pollution, and saving air quality, but saving jobs and
energy? Though it may seem as if it were counterfeit, it's true. We’ve gone through the
Recycling, but the Non-recycling? Well for starters, ever seen turtles suffering in plastic? If so,
then you probably felt a sword pierce your heart while witnessing it. That sword is the result of
not recycling. All your precious finite materials like forests, fossil fuels, minerals, and water
would deplete and thus, degrade the environment. On top of that, the greenhouse gases
released by landfills would contribute to global warming.

CONCLUSION
I hope you have moved after reading this essay, and remember, If you want to enjoy the
pleasures of the futuristic inventions like Flying cars or GTA VI, then we all have to work
together to, avoid the dystopian future that lays ahead.


