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Section 1: 

#1 "Sophia stood at the threshold of the emergency room, the hum of fluorescent lights above her 
a constant reminder of the work that never stopped. The world outside felt frozen, as if time had 
taken a breath, but inside, the hospital was alive with the frantic pulse of life and death. Her heart, 
heavy with grief, seemed to throb with the rhythm of the machines that beeped and whirred 
around her." 

Strengths: Your vivid sensory details create an immersive hospital atmosphere. Your contrast 
between the frozen outside world and the alive hospital effectively establishes tension. 

Weakness: Emotional depth needs expansion → Your protagonist's grief feels mentioned rather 
than deeply felt. The connection between her grandmother's death and her current emotional state 
needs stronger development to fully engage readers with her pain. Phrases like "heavy with grief" 
tell us about her feelings without showing their impact on her actions or thoughts. 

The fluorescent lights buzzed overhead as Sophia stood frozen at the emergency room 
entrance, her shoulders heavy with a grief so raw it seemed to pulse in time with the monitors 
around her. Outside, the world had stopped when she'd received the news about her 
grandmother, but in here, life and death continued their relentless dance. 

#2 "She moved instinctively, guiding the woman through the storm of noise and chaos, her hands 
steady despite the flood of emotion threatening to overtake her. She adjusted the oxygen mask 
with careful fingers, monitoring the heart rate as the trauma team worked around her." 

Strengths: Your action verbs show Sophia's professionalism amid her personal struggle. Your 
focus on physical movements effectively demonstrates her commitment to her patient. 

Weakness: Limited personal connection → There's not enough emotional connection established 
between Sophia and the elderly patient to justify the healing that happens later. The similarities 
between the patient and grandmother need more development through specific memories or 
thoughts that occur to Sophia during treatment. 

Despite the chaos, Sophia's hands remained steady as she adjusted the oxygen mask – the same 
gentle touch she'd used when fixing her grandmother's pillows just days before. Every beep of 
the monitor seemed to whisper memories as she worked, the familiar wrinkles on the patient's 
hand eerily similar to ones she'd held throughout her childhood. 

#3 "It wasn't enough to erase the grief, but in that moment, it was enough to remind her that 
healing, like life, could still be found even in the darkest corners." 

 



 
Strengths: Your ending offers meaningful reflection on grief and healing. Your metaphor about 
finding hope in darkness effectively summarises the narrative's theme. 

Weakness: Rushed resolution → The ending feels too quick without showing a more detailed 
process of how Sophia's healing begins. The emotional journey from overwhelming grief to 
finding purpose needs more specific moments of realisation or change. The shift feels sudden 
rather than earned through the narrative. 

The weight of grief hadn't disappeared – it had simply shifted, making room for something 
else. As Ms. Larkins' breathing steadied beneath her watchful care, Sophia felt a tiny spark 
rekindle within her: not happiness, not yet, but perhaps the first fragile seedling of healing 
taking root in the garden of her sorrow. 

Your narrative presents a poignant exploration of grief and professional duty. The hospital setting 
creates a compelling backdrop for examining how helping others can begin healing our own 
wounds. The parallel between Sophia's grandmother and her elderly patient offers meaningful 
symbolic potential. 

To strengthen your piece, consider developing Sophia's memories of her grandmother more 
specifically. What particular gestures, sayings or habits do the elderly patient's actions remind her 
of? Additionally, show her emotional journey through more physical sensations and specific 
thoughts rather than general statements about grief. The contrast between professional composure 
and personal turmoil could be heightened by incorporating more sensory details that trigger 
memories. 

Your writing would benefit from slowing down key emotional moments. When Sophia first sees 
the patient and makes the connection to her grandmother, pause the action to explore this 
realisation more fully. Also, consider adding a small flashback or specific memory that connects 
her current actions to experiences with her grandmother. Finally, develop the ending to show 
more specific signs of her beginning to heal rather than stating it directly. 

■ The strongest elements of your story are the powerful premise and emotional core. You've 
created a character whose professional responsibility conflicts with personal grief, which 
generates natural tension. Your setting details effectively establish the medical environment. To 
enhance your narrative, focus on deepening the emotional journey through more specific 
memories, physical sensations of grief, and a more gradual path toward healing. Rather than 
telling readers about Sophia's emotions, show how these feelings manifest in her thoughts, body 
language, and interactions with others. Breaking through the professional exterior to reveal more 
vulnerable moments would create a richer emotional landscape for readers to connect with. 

 

 



 
Overall Score: 42/50 

 

Section 2: 

The Heart Of Healing 

Sophia stood at the threshold of the emergency room, the hum of fluorescent lights above her a 
constant reminder of the work that never stopped. The world outside felt frozen, as if time had 
taken a breath, but inside, the hospital was alive with the frantic pulse of life and death. Her heart, 
heavy with grief, seemed to throb with the rhythm of the machines that beeped and whirred 
around her. #1 Her grandmother, the woman who had been both mother and guide, had passed 
away earlier that day, but here she was, still in uniform, still at her post. Grief had no place in this 
moment, not yet. The doors flew open, and the paramedics rushed in, bringing with them a 
stretcher, the body on it pale, battered, and frail. An elderly woman, her fragile body ravaged by 
the brutality of a car accident. The marks of the crash were visible: broken bones, deep cuts, and 
the rapid, uneven rise and fall of her chest. [The marks of the crash were visible: broken bones, 
deep cuts, and her chest rose and fell in rapid, uneven movements.] Sophia's throat tightened. The 
sight of her—her wrinkled skin, the slow pulse beneath her fingers—made her think of her 
grandmother. The ache of loss crept up her spine, but she forced it down. There was no time. #2 
She moved instinctively, guiding the woman through the storm of noise and chaos, her hands 
steady despite the flood of emotion threatening to overtake her. She adjusted the oxygen mask 
with careful fingers, monitoring the heart rate as the trauma team worked around her. The weight 
of the day, of the past few weeks, of the grief lodged deep within her chest, felt almost 
unbearable. Yet, as she focused on the woman before her, she willed herself to let go of 
everything else. The woman was still breathing, still hanging on, and that was all that mattered. 

Time blurred. Seconds stretched into what felt like hours. The rhythm of the machines, once 
erratic and chaotic, slowly began to stabilise. The steady rise and fall of the woman's chest 
became more even. The frantic beeping slowed. There was a shift, a moment where the sharpness 
of the crisis faded just enough to let in a glimmer of hope. Sophia remained at her side, her body 
aching with fatigue, but her mind clear and focused. She had seen moments like this 
before—moments when everything hung in the balance—but today, there was something 
different. The small victory, the glimmer of life in the frail body before her, was more than just 
medical success. It was a lifeline, a fragile thread that connected her to something beyond the 
pain, beyond the loss. In helping someone else hold on, she had, in some way, held on too. 

The trauma team moved in to confirm that Ms. Larkins would survive, the finality of their words 
settling in the air like a soft exhale. For the first time in hours, Sophia allowed herself a breath. 
The weight in her chest, while still present, felt a little lighter. She stood there, her gaze fixed on 
the woman who had, in some strange way, reminded her of all the things she had lost and all the 

 



 
things she still had the power to save. #3 It wasn't enough to erase the grief, but in that moment, it 
was enough to remind her that healing, like life, could still be found even in the darkest corners. 

 

 

 


